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The U.S. Trade Representative’s “2010 Trade Policy 
Agenda” states that “improved packages in services 
(providing new market access in key infrastructure 
services sectors such as financial services …)” is key to 
moving Doha forward.1 

Yet, the U.S. Senate Finance Committee, the Stiglitz 
Commission, various developing country WTO 
delegations, and a recent G-24 paper have pointed out 
that the WTO’s General Agreement on Trade in Services 
(GATS) equates “market access” with binding 
commitments to refrain from implementing new capital 
management techniques, bans on risky services and bank 
size limitations – even on a non-discriminatory basis.2 

Moreover, further GATS disciplines on non-
discriminatory, non-“market access” regulations are 
slated for adoption with the conclusion of the Doha 
Round. Accountancy sector rules have already been 
formulated, and will also be adopted. For over 100 
developing and developed countries with GATS 
financial services commitments,3 the agreement locks in 
their past “deregulation.” And, because members found 
to violate the GATS can be subject to cross-retaliation 
on their agricultural or manufacturing sectors, the 
financial services rules are of widespread interest to 
countries of varying development strategies. 

Recent official interventions have tended to confirm 
these concerns. For instance, the WTO Secretariat wrote 
in February 2010 that “the GATS could require 
individual Members to allow capital movements 
associated with a broad range of – primarily – financial 
services, depending on the level of specific commitments 
undertaken…”4  

As for regulatory bans, the WTO Secretariat wrote 
that “an outright prohibition to provide a certain 
financial service would be a trade measure subject to 
scheduling under the GATS.”5 In other words, if a 
country’s government in place in the 1990s did not think 
to schedule a ban (as was the case for the United States 
with respect to securities and derivatives, but only for 
onions futures), imposing a ban now in a committed 
sector would violate the GATS. 

Of course, proposals for new bans have abounded in 
the last year. The U.S. Securities and Exchange 
Commission is proposing bans on naked short selling 
and flash trading.6 Germany has implemented a ban on 
speculative short-selling, which a leading European trade 
think-tank has deemed a potential WTO violation – on 
the basis that (while non-discriminatory) it involves more 
regulation than implemented by other countries.7  

And, in the wake of the crisis, commentators from 
Paul Volcker to Simon Johnson to John McCain agree 

that banks got “too big to fail”, and that firewalls and 
other size limitations need to be reinstituted. But the 
GATS market access rules could limit countries’ ability 
to impose firewalls between distinct service sectors, such 
as between banking and securities, or between banking 
and insurance. Indeed, a WTO panel has never ruled to 
the contrary.8 

In response to these concerns, some sources have 
cited the agreement’s defence provision for prudential 
measures. However, this provision also reads that, 
“Where such measures do not conform with the 
provisions of the Agreement, they shall not be used as a 
means of avoiding the Member’s commitments or 
obligations under the Agreement.”9 

While Malaysia and other developing countries had 
fought, during the Uruguay Round negotiations, for a 
more robust prudential measures defence provision,10 
the final language states that prudential measures are 
only allowed under GATS rules if they do not violate any 
of the GATS rules. Prudential financial measures are 
subject to dispute settlement, and could be ruled 
against.11 Indeed, while analysts disagree about how the 
GATS prudential measure defence clause would operate 
if triggered as a defence, it does not prohibit challenges 
of prudential measures, and a WTO tribunal would have 
the final say.  A WTO panelist has written that “The 
right of a member to issue or maintain such prudential 
regulation seems to find its limits in Article XI GATS” – 
the capital controls disciplines.12 

On September 15, 2010, Hamid Mamdouh of the 
WTO Secretariat urged members to regulate fully before 
they commit to such liberalization under GATS. 
Unfortunately, a number of factors make it difficult for 
members to heed his advice. Many members have 
already made extensive financial services commitments 
under GATS before the financial crisis, without strong 
regulatory structures in place. The combination of 
existing GATS rules and new disciplines on domestic 
regulation and accountancy being contemplated in the 
Doha Round make new regulation difficult. 

Some WTO members have made strong 
interventions in the WTO General Council and the 
Committee on Trade in Financial Services (CTFS), and 
are currently withstanding the pressure to make further 
commitments. Members such as Argentina, South 
Africa, Ecuador and India urged the WTO Secretariat to 
examine the financial crisis and relevant GATS 
provisions.  
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